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The Australian Sex Party Victorian Policies  

Arts - Read More

    
    -  Protect live music venues from burdensome licensing requirements   

    
    -  Hold government to its accord with the community to promote live music in Victoria  

    
    -  Call for introduction of 24-hour train services on weekends  

    
    -  Support investment in digital delivery and consumption models that protect copyright and
royalties of Victoria’s musicians   

    
    -  Call for the introduction of a dedicated funding program for artists with disabilities  

    
    -  Call for review of funding available to independent and community arts  

    
    -  Protect and promote freedom of artistic expression  

  

Drugs - Read More

    
    -  Decriminalisation of all drugs for personal use   

    
    -  Infractions to be treated in an administrative framework outside the criminal justice system
 

    
    -  Immediate cessation of the use of drug sniffer dogs in public places  

    
    -  Legalise the prescription of heroin to registered and habitual users   
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    -  Legalise and regulate cannabis for specific medical use  

    
    -  Fund community overdose prevention initiatives, such as supervised injecting facilities  

    
    -  Subsidise high quality drug testing kits available in pharmacies, at age-restricted premises
and through needle and syringe programs   

  

  

Education - Read More

    
    -  Call for an increased focus on political literacy in the implementation of Phase Three of the
Australian Curriculum   

    
    -  Advocate for non-compulsory voting franchise to be extended to 16 to 18 year olds  

    
    -  Support schools to develop innovative and individual programs to provide for their
students   

    
    -  Educate students on safe use of information and communication technologies  

    
    -  Advocate for secular public schools  

    
    -  Call for the complete cessation of chaplains in government schools and mandate that
counsellors possessing psychology qualifications be available to all students   

    
    -  Replace the Christian volunteer-run Special Religious Instruction program in public
schools with curriculum-based units on Comparative Religion and Ethics   

    
    -  Attach requirements on public funding to private schools that their policies be
non-discriminatory and inclusive of all students, in line with public expectations   
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Privacy and Data Retention - Read More

    
    -  Protect the private lives of all Australians through the creation of a statutory right to
privacy, and stronger protections against breach of privacy.   

    
    -  Institute stricter privacy requirements for transport organisations such as Myki and
CityLink as regards sharing customer data with third parties and government agencies, and
ensure that any law enforcement access to personal data is subject to strict judicial oversight 
 

    
    -  Oppose the mandatory retention of personal internet usage data, including browsing
history and emails, by internet service providers for use by law enforcement.   

    
    -  Institute a moratorium on additional speed cameras and CCTV surveillance in public
pending further study on the effectiveness of these measures in reducing road deaths and
street crime, respectively.   

    
    -  Call for an immediate end to random police searches in public without cause.  

  

Sex Work - Read More

    
    -  Decriminalise the sex industry  

    
    -  Establish an advocacy organisation to protect the rights and interests of sex workers,
funded by the state but operating independently   

    
    -  Bring regulation of sex workers into line with regulation of other industries  

  

Transport - Read More

    
    -  Put pressure on the incoming government to provide investment and undertake

 3 / 5

index.php?option=com_content&amp;amp;view=article&amp;amp;id=917&amp;amp;catid=23&amp;amp;Itemid=49
index.php?option=com_content&amp;amp;view=article&amp;amp;id=918&amp;amp;catid=23&amp;amp;Itemid=49
index.php?option=com_content&amp;amp;view=article&amp;amp;id=919&amp;amp;catid=23&amp;amp;Itemid=49


Australian Sex Party Victorian Policies

Written by Administrator
Wednesday, 17 November 2010 10:33 - Last Updated Wednesday, 24 November 2010 11:17

forward-thinking infrastructure projects   

    
    -  Advocate that stages One and Two of the Melbourne Metro Rail Tunnel be planned and
delivered simultaneously, to realise economic and patronage benefits for the taxpayer, and
residents and business of St Kilda Road   

    
    -  Call for the separation of Regional and Metropolitan services within the metropolitan
network, to facilitate and upgrade of the network to a metro-style system   

    
    -  Advocate for the implementation of modern rail technologies, such as Automatic Signalling
 

    
    -  Call for 24 hour train services on weekends, with appropriate security personnel (see Live
Music Policy)   

  

Health - Read More

    
    -  The implementation of the recommendations of the National Hospitals and Health Reform
Commission should not impact on the high standard of community health in Victoria   

    
    -  A focus on sexual health initiatives that are often overlooked despite growing evidence
and community support   

    
    -  Support the partnership of communities as active in health care with the government,
health and research sectors   

    
    -  Support for evidence-based models of mental health service delivery that are a true
integration of all levels of care, with a focus on community development and long term
strategies to improve the standard of people living with a mental health and/or substance use
disorder   

  

Sex  - Crime and the Spanner Case

 4 / 5

index.php?option=com_content&amp;amp;view=article&amp;amp;id=929&amp;amp;catid=23&amp;amp;Itemid=49


Australian Sex Party Victorian Policies

Written by Administrator
Wednesday, 17 November 2010 10:33 - Last Updated Wednesday, 24 November 2010 11:17

    
    -  Resolve ambiguity surrounding the legality of various forms of sexual activity by amending
section 31 of the Crimes Act 1958 (Vic) to provide that consent is a defence against assault
charges, where consent is informed and provided free from duress   

  

Equality – Reproduction Rights

    
    -  Remove any restrictions preventing same-sex couples from adopting  

    
    -  Require private service providers to provide for same-sex individuals in a
non-discriminatory manner, including adoption and IVF services   

    
    -  Advocate for amendment to surrogacy laws such that the intended care-givers can
become the legal guardians of the child without going through adoption processes   

    

Click Here for Federal Sex Party Policies
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